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This QRC outlines the steps for using iLab to reserve time on equipment within a recharge center, lab or facility. 

Access iLab 

Go to the iLab solutions site 
using the direct link or the One 
Purdue Portal and login using 
your Boilerkey credentials. Help 
logging in to iLab using 
Boilerkey can be found here. 

purdue.ilabsolutions.com 

 

Access Desired Facility 

Click Core Facilities. 

 

Click the name of the desired 
facility for which you have 
access. 

 

The About Our Core page for 
the selected facility is displayed. 

 

Select and Reserve Equipment 

Click Schedule Equipment. 
 

Locate desired equipment and 
click the corresponding view 
schedule button. 
 
NOTE: If training on equipment 
is required, click initiate 

 

https://one.purdue.edu/
https://one.purdue.edu/
http://purdue.edu/ilab/files/qrc/How%20to%20login%20to%20iLab.pdf
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training and complete form to 
schedule training.   

Navigate to desired week, 
locate day of the week and click 
and drag to select preferred 
time. 

 

Requested forms contain any 
form that is required prior to use 
of the selected equipment. 
Complete form(s), if needed.  

Review Reservation details. 
 
Add Event Notes if reservation 
requires special instructions.  

Review Times of reservation. 

 

Review Use and cost of 
reservation. 

 

All users have a default account 
assignment. 
 
Review Payment Information 
to ensure the proper account 
will be charged for this 
reservation. 
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To split charges among multiple 
accounts, click Split Charge. 
Allocate to each account by 
percentage. 
 
NOTE: Only account for which 
access is authorized are 
displayed.  

To notify a user in addition to 
the facility of this reservation, 
add email address. 

 

Click Save Reservation to 
submit. 
 
Click Cancel Changes or 
Delete Reservation to start 
over. 

 

 

View Reservations 

Under Core Facilities, click my 
reservations. 

 

All reservations from the past, 
for today and for the future are 
listed. 
 
Details can be reviewed and if 
the reservation has not yet been 
billed, account/payment 
information can be updated. 

 
 


